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Court File No. BK-23-02929201-0032 
Estate No. 32-2929201 

ONTARIO  
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE 

JUSTICE CONWAY 

) 

) 

) 

MONDAY, THE 24TH 

DAY OF APRIL, 2023 

IN THE MATTER OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, RSC 1985, c B-3, AS AMENDED 

AND IN THE MATTER OF THE NOTICE OF INTENTION TO MAKE A 
PROPOSAL OF PROSYSCO LTD. OF THE CITY OF TORONTO IN THE 

PROVINCE OF ONTARIO 

ORDER 
(Re: Administrative Consolidation and Related Relief) 

THIS MOTION made by Prosysco Ltd. (the “Company”) for an order, inter alia, 

extending the time to file a proposal for a period of 45 days and administratively consolidating the 

two NOI Proceedings (as defined below) was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, 

Ontario by video conference. 

ON READING the Affidavit of Terrence Scott sworn April 18, 2023, and the First Report 

of Albert Gelman Inc. in its capacity as proposal trustee (the “Proposal Trustee”), and on hearing 

the submissions of respective counsel for the Company, the Proposal Trustee, the Royal Bank of 

Canada and such other counsel as were present as listed on the counsel slip, no one appearing for 

any other person on the service list, although properly served as appears from the affidavit of 

service of Jessica Wuthmann sworn April 19, 2023, filed: 
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SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and the Motion

Record is hereby abridged and validated so that this Motion is properly returnable today and hereby 

dispenses with further service thereof. 

PROCEDURAL CONSOLIDATION 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that, without prejudice to the right of any party to seek or oppose

substantive consolidation, 

(a) the present proceeding; and

(b) the matter of the notice of intention to make a proposal of 1110615 Ontario Ltd.

Bankruptcy Court File No. BK-23-02929202-0032 and Estate No. 32-2929202,

(collectively, the “NOI Proceedings”)

shall be procedurally consolidated and the Proposal Trustee shall be authorized and directed to 

administer the NOI Proceedings on a consolidated basis for all purposes in carrying out its 

administrative duties and other responsibilities as trustee under the Bankruptcy and Insolvency 

Act (the “BIA”), including, without limitation, the following: 

(a) sending notices to the creditors of Prosysco Ltd. and 1110615 Ontario Ltd.

(collectively, the “NOI Entities”) pursuant to one consolidated notice;

(b) calling and conducting any meetings of creditors of the NOI Entities pursuant to

one combined advertisement and one meeting;
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(c) issuing consolidated reports in respect of the estates of the NOI Entities;

(d) preparing, filing, advertising and distributing any and all filings and/or notices

relating to the administration of the estates of the NOI Entities on a consolidated

basis; and

(e) bringing motions to this Honourable Court on a consolidated basis.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the NOI Proceedings shall be assigned the single 

Bankruptcy Court File No. BK-23-02929201-0032 and Estate File Number 32-2929201 

(the “Consolidated Court File”) and the following title of proceeding: 

IN THE MATTER OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, RSC 1985, c B-3, AS AMENDED 

AND IN THE MATTER OF THE NOTICE OF INTENTION TO MAKE A 
PROPOSAL OF PROSYSCO LIMITED OF THE CITY OF TORONTO IN THE 

PROVINCE OF ONTARIO 

AND IN THE MATTER OF THE NOTICE OF INTENTION TO MAKE A 
PROPOSAL OF 1110615 ONTARIO LTD. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that a copy of this Order shall be filed by the NOI Entities in 

the court file for each of the NOI Proceedings but that any other document required to be filed in 

any of the NOI Proceedings shall hereafter only be required to be filed in the Consolidated Court 

File.  

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that for avoidance of doubt, any motion, application or action, 

including the herein motion, in respect of the NOI Entities or any of them shall be brought and 

filed in the Consolidated Court File and if so brought and filed it shall be deemed brought and filed 
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in each of the NOI Proceedings, as appropriate, without prejudice to any rules of civil procedure 

or otherwise that are applicable. 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the procedural consolidation of the NOI Proceedings shall

not: 

(a) affect the separate legal status and structures of any of the NOI Entities;

(b) cause any of the NOI Entities to be liable for any claim for which it otherwise is

not liable; or

(c) affect the Proposal Trustee’s or a creditor’s right to seek to disallow any claim,

including on the basis that such claim is a duplicative claim.

EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE A PROPOSAL 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that pursuant to Section 50.4(9) of the BIA, the time for the 

NOI Entities to file a proposal with the Official Receiver be and is hereby extended up to and 

including June 14, 2023 (the “Stay Period”).  

CONTINUATION OF SERVICES 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that during the Stay Period, all persons having oral or written 

agreements with the NOI Entities or statutory or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods 

and/or services are hereby restrained until further Order of this Court from discontinuing, altering, 

interfering with or terminating the supply of such goods or services as may be required by the NOI 

Entities, provided in each case that the normal prices or charges for such goods or services received 

after the date of this Order are paid by the NOI Entities in accordance with normal payment 
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practices of the NOI Entities or other practices as may be agreed upon by the supplier or service 

provider and each of the NOI Entities and the Proposal Trustee, or as may be ordered by this Court. 

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that the First Report of the Proposal Trustee, and the actions, 

conduct and activities of the Proposal Trustee as set out therein, be and are hereby approved; 

provided, however, that only the Proposal Trustee, in its personal capacity and only with respect 

to its own personal liability, shall be entitled to rely upon or utilize in any way such approval. 

GENERAL 

10. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, 

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States, to give effect to 

this Order and to assist the NOI Entities, the Proposal Trustee and their respective agents in carrying out 

the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby 

respectfully requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the NOI Entities and to the 

Proposal Trustee, as an officer of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order, 

to grant representative status to the Proposal Trustee in any foreign proceeding, or to assist the NOI 

Entities and the Proposal Trustee and their respective agents in carrying out the terms of this Order.  

11. THIS COURT ORDERS that any interested party (including the NOI Entities and the 

Proposal Trustee) may apply to this Court to vary or amend this Order on not less than seven (7) 

days notice to any other party or parties likely to be affected by the order sought or upon such other 

notice, if any, as this Court may order.  

12. THIS COURT ORDERS that notwithstanding Rule 59.05, this Order is effective from 

12:01 a.m. on the date that it is made and is enforceable without any need for entry and filing.  In 

accordance with Rules 77.07(6) and 1.04, no formal order need be entered and filed unless an 
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appeal or a motion for leave to appeal is brought to an appellate court.  Any party may nonetheless 

submit a formal order for original signing, entry and filing. 

_____________________________ 
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COUNSEL/ENDORSEMENT SLIP 
 

COURT FILE NO.:  BK-23-02929201-0032 
                                        BK-23-02929202-0032 

 DATE: April 24, 2023 

  NO. ON LIST: 5 & 6 

 

TITLE OF PROCEEDING:  PROSYSCO LTD. et al  

BEFORE:    JUSTICE CONWAY    

 

PARTICIPANT INFORMATION 
 

For Plaintiff, Applicant, Moving Party: 

Name of Person Appearing Name of Party Contact Info 
Jessica Wuthmann Applicants jwuthmann@reconllp.com  
   
   
   

 

For Defendant, Respondent, Responding Party: 

Name of Person Appearing Name of Party Contact Info 
   
   
   
   

 

For Other, Self-Represented: 

Name of Person Appearing Name of Party Contact Info 
Mario Forte Albert Gelman Inc. forte@gsnh.com  
Ianina Raguimov Albert Gelman Inc. iraguimov@albertgelman.com  
Thomas Masterson RBC tmasterson@harrisonpensa.com  
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mailto:forte@gsnh.com
mailto:iraguimov@albertgelman.com
mailto:tmasterson@harrisonpensa.com


ENDORSEMENT OF JUSTICE CONWAY: 

[1] The Applicants bring this motion for an order administratively consolidating the NOI proceedings 
commenced by them and extending the time for filing a proposal to June 14, 2023. 

[2] The motion is unopposed and is supported by both the senior secured creditor (RBC) and the Proposal 
Trustee. I agree that the administrative consolidation makes sense under the circumstances given the 
substantial overlap between the NOI proceedings. I also agree to the extension – the Applicants are acting 
in good faith and with due diligence, the extension will facilitate the making of a proposal, and no creditor 
will be materially prejudiced by the extension. The Proposal Trustee says that the Applicants have 
sufficient cash to continue operating during the extended period. 

[3] Order to go as signed by me and attached to this Endorsement. This order is effective from today's date 
and is enforceable without the need for entry and filing.  
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ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(IN BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY) 
 

In the Matter of the Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal of  
Prosysco Ltd. of the city of Mississauga  

in the Province of Ontario 
 

And in the Matter of the Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal of  
1110615 Ontario Ltd. of the city of Mississauga  

in the Province of Ontario 
 

FIRST REPORT OF ALBERT GELMAN INC.  
IN ITS CAPACITY AS PROPOSAL TRUSTEE  

 
(Dated April 19, 2023) 

 

I. INTRODUCTION 

1. This first report (“First Report”) is filed by Albert Gelman Inc. (“AGI”) in its capacity as proposal 

trustee (the “Proposal Trustee”) in connection with a Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal (“NOI”) filed by 

Prosysco Ltd (“Prosysco”) and 1110615 Ontario Ltd. (“111Co.”, and together with Prosysco, the 

“Companies”) on April 1, 2023 under Section 50.4(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) (the 

“BIA”). Attached hereto at Appendix “A” are copies of the NOI and Certificates of Appointment issued by 

the Office of the Superintendent of Bankruptcy for each of the Companies. 

2. The Companies are making a motion to the Court, to be heard jointly, returnable April 24, 2023 (the 

“April 24 Motion”) seeking various relief. This First Report has been prepared largely in response to and in 

support of the Companies’ April 24 Motion.  

3. On its April 24 Motion, the Companies are seeking, amongst other things, an Order: 

a. administratively consolidating the Companies’ proposal proceedings under one title of 

proceeding; and, 

b. extending the time for each of the Companies to file a proposal to June 14, 2023 (the “Stay 

Extension”); 

4. The Companies’ have filed with their April 24 Motion the affidavit of Terrence Scott sworn April 18, 

2023 (the “Scott Affidavit”), in support of the relief being sought. The Proposal Trustee has reviewed the 

Scott Affidavit and has no reason to doubt or otherwise challenge the facts attested to therein.  



  

 - 2 - 

5. For the reasons explained herein, the Proposal Trustee supports the relief sought by the Companies 

at their April 24 Motion.  

II. PURPOSE OF THIS REPORT 

6. The purpose of this First Report is to: 

a. provide the Court with relevant information pertaining to the Companies which is not otherwise 

described in the Scott Affidavit;  

b. provide information to the Court regarding the actions and activities of both the Proposal 

Trustee and the Companies subsequent to the filing of the NOI’s; and, 

c. provide the Court with the Proposal Trustee’s recommendations in respect of the relief sought 

by the Companies. 

III. SCOPE AND TERMS OF REFERENCE 

7. In preparing this First Report, the Proposal Trustee has relied upon certain unaudited financial 

information, the Companies’ books and records, discussions with management, discussions with 

representatives of Norton McMullen LLP, the Companies’ external accountant, and discussions with the 

Companies’ legal counsel, Reconstruct LLP.  

8. While the Proposal Trustee has reviewed various documents provided by management and others, 

such review does not constitute an audit or verification of such information for accuracy, completeness or 

compliance with Generally Accepted Accounting Principles (“GAAP”) or International Financial Reporting 

Standards (“IFRS”) or otherwise. Accordingly, the Proposal Trustee expresses no opinion or other form of 

assurance pursuant to GAAP or IFRS or otherwise with respect to such information except as expressly 

stated herein. 

9. This First Report has been prepared for the use of this Court and the Companies’ stakeholders as 

general information relating to the Companies and to assist the Court in making a determination of whether 

to approve the relief sought. Accordingly, the reader is cautioned that this First Report may not be appropriate 

for any other purpose. The Proposal Trustee will not assume responsibility or liability for losses incurred by 

the reader as a result of the circulation, publication, reproduction or use of this First Report contrary to the 

provisions of this paragraph. 

10. Unless otherwise noted, all monetary amounts referenced are in Canadian dollars. 

IV. BACKGROUND INFORMATION 

Reason for NOI Filing 

11. RBC is the senior secured lender to Prosysco. RBC had provided Prosysco with revolving credit 

facilities which had outstanding balances of approximately $2.33 million and US$250,000 as of March 22, 
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2023. RBC had also provided Prosysco with various term facilities and a credit card facility which on March 

22, 2023 had balances outstanding of approximately $380,000 and $53,000, respectively. Therefore, the total 

indebtedness of Prosysco to RBC was approximately $2.76 million and US$250,000 as of March 22, 2023 

plus accrued and accruing interest (the “RBC Debt”). The RBC Debt is secured by, among other things, a 

general security agreement dated June 16, 2016 (the “Prosysco Security”). 

12. 111Co. provided a limited guarantee of the RBC Debt to a maximum of $820,000. The limited 

guarantee is secured by, among other things, a general security agreement dated June 16, 2016 (the “111Co. 

Security”). RBC declared Prosysco in default on its loan obligation to RBC in or around March 22, 2023. As 

a result of the default RBC issued its Notice of Intention to Enforce a Security (the “NITES”) in accordance 

with section 244 of the BIA to both Prosysco and 111Co., which are attached as Exhibit “C” to the Scott 

Affidavit. The 10-day period set out in the NITES was set to expire on April 2, 2023. In order to stay RBC 

from enforcement action both of the Companies filed a NOI on April 1, 2023.  

13. Further background information with respect to each of the Companies is set out below.  

Prosysco Ltd. 

14. Paul Chimko was the sole officer and director of the Prosysco.  Attached to the Scott Affidavit as 

Exhibit “D” is a copy of the corporate profile search for Prosysco. Paul Chimko passed away suddenly on 

April 6, 2023. On April 10, 2023 Alan Chimko was elected the sole director of Prosyco pursuant to a resolution 

of the shareholders. On April 10, 2023 Terrence Scott was appointed as President and Secretary of Prosysco 

pursuant to a resolution of the director.  

15. Prosysco is a supplier of highly specialized engineered process solutions and is certified and 

equipped to manufacture process equipment, process vessels and high purity piping systems in-house. Its 

clients principally include, among others, companies in the biotech, pharmaceutical, food, beverage and dairy 

industries. Prosysco employs approximately 62 employees. Prosysco’s employees are not unionized. 

Prosysco leases its head office which is located at 8 Prologis Boulevard in Mississauga, Ontario. Prosysco 

leases manufacturing facilities located at 360 and 380 Ambassador Drive in Mississauga, Ontario. Prosysco’s 

gross revenues during its fiscal years ended February 28, 2020 and 2021 were approximately $14.2 million 

and $11.5 million, respectively. Prosysco’s 2022 financial statements have not yet been prepared by its 

external accountant, the reasons for which are included in the Scott Affidavit.  

16. Further background information about Prosysco is contained in the Scott Affidavit. The Scott Affidavit 

also includes details about the causes of the Prosysco’s financial difficulties.  

17. The material assets of Prosysco include its accounts receivable, work-in-process inventory, finished 

goods inventory, machinery and equipment and vehicles. Certain details about these assets are included in 

the Scott Affidavit. The Proposal Trustee will provide further details to the Court regarding Prosysco’s material 

assets at a later date.  

1110615 Ontario Ltd. 
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18. Alan Chimko is the sole director of 111Co. Attached to the Scott Affidavit as Exhibit “E” is a copy of 

the corporate profile search for 111Co.  

19. 111Co. is a holding company and is not engaged in active business. 111Co’s only material asset are 

set out below. 

a. common shares in Prosysco. 111Co. is the majority shareholder of Prosysco. The other 

minority shareholders are Adam Kurtz and Dmitry Puzhitsky, both of whom are management 

level employees of Prosysco; 

b. loans due from Prosysco and North Quest Vision (formerly 2090985 Ontario Inc.), a company 

related to 111Co. 

20. According to the draft version of 111Co.’s fiscal year ended February 28, 2022 financial statements, 

which are in draft but which the Proposal Trustee has been advised will be issued in final from in due course, 

indicates that this company has no material liabilities, other than its indebtedness to RBC in respect of its 

guarantee of Prosysco’s indebtedness.  

21. Further background information about 111Co. is contained in the Scott Affidavit.  

V. SECURED CREDITORS  

Prosysco Ltd. 

22. A search of the public registry for the PPSA indicates that the following creditors have registered 

financing/change statements against Prosysco: 
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23. A copy of the PPSA search with a file currency date of March 28, 2023 is attached hereto as 

Appendix “B”.  

Royal Bank of Canada 

24. As was noted above, RBC is Prosysco’s senior secured creditor. RBC provided Prosysco with 

several term loans, both a CDN dollar and US dollar revolving line of credit and credit card facilities.  The 

Proposal Trustee has been advised by RBC that the amount owing to RBC was approximately $2.76 million 

and US$250,000 as of March 22, 2023 plus accrued and accruing interest (defined above as the RBC Debt).  

Prosysco provided a general security agreement in favour of RBC as security for the RBC Debt. 111Co. 

provided a general security agreement securing its limited guarantee of the RBC Debt in favour of RBC. 

Together the Prosysco Security and the 111Co. Security are together referred to as the “RBC Security.”  

25. The Proposal Trustee has engaged Goldman Sloan Nash and Haber LLP (“GSNH”) to provide 

independent legal opinions in respect of the validity and enforceability of the RBC Security (the “RBC 

Security Opinions”). GSNH has provided a favourable opinion on the RBC Security. Copies of the RBC 

Registration Date Creditor Collateral Classification

May 30, 2013 Royal Bank of Canada Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle 

November 23, 2017 Royal Bank of Canada Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other

September 19, 2018 Echelon Insurance Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle 

March 5, 2019 Royal Bank of Canada Consumer Goods, Other, Motor Vehicle 

March 5, 2019 Royal Bank of Canada Consumer Goods, Other, Motor Vehicle 

April 2, 2019 Royal Bank of Canada Equipment, Other

October 22, 2019 De Lage Landen Financial Services Canada Inc. Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle 

November 19, 2019 Royal Bank of Canada Equipment, Other

October 30, 2020 Royal Bank of Canada Consumer Goods, Other, Motor Vehicle 

November 2, 2020 Ford Credit Canada Company Equipment, Other

November 19, 2020 Royal Bank of Canada Consumer Goods, Other, Motor Vehicle 

December 7, 2020 Toyota Credit Canada Inc. Consumer Goods, Equipment, Other, Motor Vehicle 

February 4, 2021 The Bank of Nova Scotia Equipment, Other, Motor Vehicle 

March 16, 2021 Honda Canada Finance Inc. Consumer Goods, Equipment, Motor Vehicle 

May 25, 2021 Royal Bank of Canada Equipment, Other

June 15, 2021 Toyota Credit Canada Inc. Consumer Goods, Equipment, Other, Motor Vehicle 

June 16, 2021 Royal Bank of Canada Equipment, Other, Motor Vehicle 

June 29, 2021 Vault Credit Corporation Equipment, Other

July 5, 2021 BMW Canada Inc. Consumer Goods, Equipment, Other, Motor Vehicle 

July 22, 2021 Vault Credit Corporation Equipment, Other

September 23, 2021 Vault Credit Corporation Equipment, Other

October 1, 2021 Meridian Onecap Credit Corp. Equipment, Other

October 13, 2021 Vault Credit Corporation Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other

October 17, 2021 Meridian Onecap Credit Corp. Equipment, Other

October 27, 2021 Meridian Onecap Credit Corp. Equipment, Other

January 27, 2022 CWB National Leasing Inc. Equipment

June 20, 2022 Bercon Rentals Inc. Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle 

July 8, 2022 Royal Bank of Canada Equipment, Other

October 13, 2022 Bercon Rentals Inc. Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle 

October 27, 2022 Her Majesty in right of Ontario represented by the 

Minister of Finance

Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle 

November 11, 2022 ATCO Structures & Logistics Ltd. Other
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Security Opinions are attached hereto as Appendix “C”. RBC has the earliest registered financing 

statements against both Prosysco and 111Co.  

Other Secured Creditors 

26. As set out in the chart above, there are several creditors, other than RBC, who have registered 

financing statements. These registrations have not been investigated by the Proposal Trustee as of the date 

of this First Report. The Proposal Trustee will provide further details to Court at a later date with respect to 

each of these registrations.  

Deemed Trust – CRA 

Prosysco is indebted to the CRA in respect of unpaid source deductions in the total amount of approximately 

$1.63 million.  

1110615 Ontario Ltd. 

27. Pursuant to a PPSA search conducted by the Proposal Trustee on March 29, 2023 (with a file 

currency date of March 28, 2023), the following creditors have registered financing statements against 

111Co.: 

 

28. A copy of the PPSA search is attached hereto as Appendix “D”.  

Royal Bank of Canada 

29. Details of the 111Co. Security are referred to above and included in the RBC Security Opinions. RBC 

has the earliest registrations reflected in the PPSA search results. 

Echelon Insurance 

30. The Proposal Trustee as not investigated the registration of Echelon Insurance of the date of this 

First Report. The Proposal Trustee will provide further details to Court at a later date with respect to this 

registration.  

VI. UNSECURED CREDITORS  

Prosysco Ltd. 

31. Prosysco listed approximately $1.8 million of arm’s length unsecured claims in its NOI.  

32. As set out in the Scott Affidavit, management intends to disclaim Prosysco’s commercial head office 

leases.  This landlord will have an unsecured claim in accordance with section 65.2(4) of the BIA. The 

landlord’s claim has not been estimated at this time.  

Registration Date Creditor Collateral Classification

June 14, 2016 Royal Bank of Canada Inventory, Equipment, Accounts, Other, Motor Vehicle

September 19, 2018 Echelon Insurance Other
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33. Prosysco listed $2.5 million as an estimate of the amounts owing to shareholders and other non-

arm’s length unsecured creditors. Prosysco is in the process of updated its accounting records and, once 

completed, the amounts owing to non-arm’s length creditors will be known. The Trustee will provide the Court 

with a further update at a later date.  

1110615 Ontario Ltd. 

34. The only unsecured creditor listed on 111Co’s NOI was Prosysco in the amount of $128,000.  

35. The Proposal Trustee provided notice of the NOI proceedings to the CRA. The CRA has not yet 

contacted the Proposal Trustee as of the date of this First Report.  

VII. ACTIVITIES OF THE COMPANIES  

36. Since the date of the filing of the NOI, the Companies have undertaken, among other things, the 

following activities: 

a. advised various stakeholders, including management, relevant employees, and important 

suppliers of these restructuring proceedings;  

b. met with various prospective lenders to discuss obtaining longer term financing to payout RBC 

and the CRA in respect of its unpaid source deductions;  

c. had informal discussions with various secured and unsecured creditors in respect of the 

restructuring proceedings;  

d. attended meetings with the Proposal Trustee to discuss its objectives and options in respect 

of these restructuring proceedings; 

e. prepared its Cash Flow Forecasts (defined below) with the assistance of the Proposal Trustee; 

and 

f. provided the Proposal Trustee, on an ongoing basis, with financial and other information in 

order to allow the Proposal Trustee to monitor its cash receipts and disbursements. 

37. The Companies are requesting an extension of time to file their proposals so that they may, among 

other things, have additional time to stabilize their business operations and to develop a proposal to their 

creditors. The Companies are also continuing to canvas the market to find additional longer-term financing 

in order to payout the RBC Debt in full, retire unpaid source deductions and, generally, to recapitalize the 

business. As further discussed below, the Proposal Trustee supports the Companies’ request for the Stay 

Extension.  

VIII. ACTIVITIES OF THE PROPOSAL TRUSTEE 

38. Since the date of the filing of the NOI the Proposal Trustee has undertaken, among other things, the 

following activities: 
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a. on April 6, 2023 the Proposal Trustee mailed to every known creditor a copy of the NOI as 

required under subsection 50.4(6) of the BIA.  A copy of the affidavits of mailing are collectively 

attached hereto as Appendix “E”; 

b. assisted the Companies in their efforts to obtain longer-term financing by contacting several 

lenders with expertise and experience in working with companies engaged in active 

restructuring proceedings;   

c. corresponded with RBC’s legal counsel;  

d. engaged GSNH as its independent legal counsel;  

e. engaged GSNH to provide an independent legal opinion with respect to the validity and 

enforceability of the security of RBC over the Companies;  

f. assisted the Companies with the preparation of the Cash Flow Forecast (defined below);  

g. implemented procedures with the Companies’ management and employees in order to allow 

the Proposal Trustee to consistently monitor the receipts and disbursements of the Companies 

and compare same to the Cash Flow Forecast for variances;  

h. communicated extensively with management of the Companies and the Companies’ legal 

counsel to discuss, among other things, the following;  

i. the business, financial affairs and future prospects of the Companies;  

ii. the options available to the Companies in relation to the NOI proceedings; and, 

iii. requirements for short- and long-term financing. 

i. communicated with several creditors and other stakeholders who contacted the Proposal 

Trustee directly regarding the status of these restructuring proceedings; and, 

j. established a Case Webpage to post Court materials related to these restructuring 

proceedings, located at www.albertgelman.com/corporate-solutions/other-engagements/   

IX. CASH FLOW FORECASTS 

39. On April 10, 2023 the Companies each filed with the Proposal Trustee a statement of projected cash 

flows prepared on a weekly basis for the period of April 9 to July 1, 2023 (“Cash Flow Forecasts”), along 

with management’s report on the reasonableness of the Cash Flow Forecast, in accordance with subsection 

50.4(2) of the BIA. The Cash Flow Forecasts of Prosyco and 111Co. are attached to the Scott Affidavit as 

Exhibits “J” and “K”, respectively.  

40. In the Proposal Trustee’s opinion, the Cash Flow Forecasts demonstrate that the Companies can 

continue to operate during the forecast period without material prejudice to any of the Companies’ creditors. 
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The accuracy of the Cash Flow Forecasts are subject to the assumptions contained within the forecast and 

set out in the forecast notes. 

X. REQUEST FOR EXTENSION 

41. The Companies are seeking the Stay Extension pursuant to subsection 50.4(9) of the BIA.   

42. The Proposal Trustee supports the Stay Extension as it is of the opinion that: 

a. the Companies have acted, and are acting, in good faith and with due diligence; 

b. the Companies would likely be able to make a viable Proposal if the extension being applied 

for were granted; and, 

c. no creditor would be materially prejudiced if the extension being applied for were granted. 

43. The Proposal Trustee is also of the opinion that a Proposal developed by each of the Companies is 

more beneficial to all stakeholders than an immediate forced shut down of the Companies anda  liquidation 

of the Companies’ assets. This is so because a Proposal: (a) would likely provide for a significantly greater 

return to the Companies’ unsecured creditors; (b) would result in continued employment for Prosysco’s 

approximately 62 employees; and, (c) would result in a more orderly and efficient process to distribute funds 

to the Companies’ secured and unsecured creditors. 

XI. PROPOSAL TRUSTEE’S RECOMMENDATION 

44. For the reasons explained herein, the Proposal Trustee respectfully recommends that this 

Honourable Court make an Order or Orders approving: 

a. the administrative consolidation of the Companies’ proposal proceedings under one title of 

proceeding;  

b. the Stay Extension; and, 

c. the actions and activities of the Proposal Trustee as described in this First Report. 

 

All of which is respectfully submitted this 19th day of April 2023 

ALBERT GELMAN INC., solely in its 
capacity as Trustee of re the Notice of  
Intention to Make a Proposal of  
Prosysco Ltd.  and 1110615 Ontario Ltd. 
and not its Personal or any other Capacity 
 
 
Per:             
 Bryan Gelman, CIRP, LIT 
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Court File No. BK-23-02929201-0032 
Estate No.: 32-2929202 

 
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
 

In the Matter of the Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal of  
Prosysco Ltd. of the city of Mississauga  

in the Province of Ontario 
 

And in the Matter of the Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal of  
1110615 Ontario Ltd. of the city of Mississauga  

in the Province of Ontario 
 

PROPOSAL TRUSTEE’S AFFIDAVIT OF FEES 

I, Bryan Gelman, of the City of Toronto, make oath and say as follows: 
 

1. I am a Licenced Insolvency Trustee and principal of Albert Gelman Inc. (“Proposal Trustee”), Trustee of 

the Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal filed by both of Prosysco Ltd. (“Prosysco”) and 1110615 
Ontario Ltd. (“111Co.”) and as such have knowledge of the facts herein deposed to. 

 
2. The Proposal Trustee has prepared invoices in connection with its fees as follows: 

  
a. an account issued to Prosysco dated May 8, 2023 for the period to April 30, 2023 of $73,357.50, 

plus HST thereon;  
 

b. an account issued to 111Co. dated May 8, 2023 for the period to April 30, 2023 of $6,778.50 plus 
HST thereon; and, 

 
c. an account issued to Prosysco dated June 5, 2023 for the period May 1 to June 5, 2023 of 

$25,341.50 plus HST thereon. 
 

3. A summary of the Proposal Trustee’s time by staff member is as follows: 
 

 
 
 

Staff member Position

Hours 

worked

Hourly 

rate Total
($) ($)

Bryan Gelman, CIRP, LIT Principal 56.4      565.00      31,866.00    
Joe Albert, CPA, CA, DIFA, CIRP, LIT Principal 0.1        630.00      63.00           
Tom McElroy, CPA, CA, CBV, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 45.7      495.00      22,621.50    
Suzette Warner, CFE, CPA, CGA, FCCA Associate 3.5        395.00      1,382.50      
Ianina Raguimov, CIRP, LIT Associate 121.8    395.00      48,111.00    
Ashely Robinson Estate Administrator 4.7        305.00      1,433.50      

232.2    454.25      105,477.50  



 

 

4. The Proposal Trustee’s total fees are $105,477.50, its total hours spent is 232.2 and, therefore, its 
average hourly rate is calculated to be $454.25. 
 

5. The Proposal Trustee’s accounts, including detailed time dockets, are attached hereto as Exhibit “A”.   

6. This Affidavit is made in support of a motion to approve the accounts of Albert Gelman Inc. and for no 
improper purpose. 
 

 
Sworn remotely by Bryan Gelman at Toronto, Ontario   }      
before me at Toronto, Ontario in accordance with       }    
O. Reg. 431/20, Administering Oath or Declaration    } 
Remotely, the 7th day of June 2023       } ______________________________ 
       Bryan Gelman 

 
 
 
__________________________________ 
Thomas John McElroy, a Commissioner, etc., 
Province of Ontario, for Albert Gelman Inc. 
Expires February 14, 2025 
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

Professional Fees:

DescriptionEmployee Rate AmountDate Hours

BGELMAN2023-03-29 $282.50 0.50 $565.00Initial call with Paul Chimko; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-03-29 $395.00 1.00 $395.00Initial call with debtor, Bryan and Suzette; researched 

financial problems and various solutions available to the 

company

BGELMAN2023-03-30 $4,068.00 7.20 $565.00Review of all financial information provided by Debtor; 

calls (multiple) with Brendan Bissell re update; Travel to 

and attend meeting at Debtor's office for management 

meeting; continued review of financial information 

provided by Debtor; call with VP Finance (Terry) re 

parent company and emails re same; meeting with 

Ianina R. (AGI) re file input and instructions for next 

steps; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-03-30 $4,147.50 10.50 $395.00Visited debtor on site; meeting with the management 

team; financial data analysis; reviewed financial 

statements; data entry in Ascend; additional 

communication with debtor through email

SWARNER2023-03-30 $197.50 0.50 $395.00Formatting of excel template for creditors upload

BGELMAN2023-03-31 $1,864.50 3.30 $565.00Attend conference call with Management; Follow up 

debrief with Brendan Bissell re next steps; Review of NOI 

documents and instructions to Ianina re changes; 

multiple calls with Brendan Bissell; review of draft NOI 

sign up docs; conference call with Brendan Bissell and 

Paul Chimco re NOI sign up; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-03-31 $2,765.00 7.00 $395.00Reviewed financial statements; meeting with debtors 

and lawyer;  prepared file in Ascend

BGELMAN2023-04-01 $1,412.50 2.50 $565.00Attend management meeting and prepare for and 

attend sign up meeting of NOI; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-01 $1,343.00 3.40 $395.00Reviewed financial documents; attended meeting with 

management; prepared signing documents

BGELMAN2023-04-03 $904.00 1.60 $565.00Call to David Kennedy at RBC re update; update Paul 

Chimko re next steps with several phone calls; contact 

multiple prospective lenders to discuss short and long 

term financing; Emails to Debtor and team re finance 

meeting and agenda; 

SWARNER2023-04-03 $395.00 1.00 $395.00Attended call with AGI team, Debtor representatives 

and legal counsel to discuss cash flow and next steps

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-03 $434.50 1.10 $395.00Reviewed AP and AR, reviewed CF model

TMCELROY2023-04-04 $544.50 1.10 $495.00Conference call with management and Debtor legal 

counse re various matters; Call with Terry to discuss cash 

flow and payments to be returned; 

SWARNER2023-04-04 $395.00 1.00 $395.00representatives and legal counsel to discuss cash flow 

and next steps
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

Professional Fees:

DescriptionEmployee Rate AmountDate Hours

BGELMAN2023-04-04 $1,073.50 1.90 $565.00Attend call with management and finance VP re cash 

flow and next steps; Attend conference call with 

Brendan Bissell and Tim Hogan; Update call with Terry 

Scott; emails introductions to three prospective lenders 

for short/long term capital; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-04 $553.00 1.40 $395.00Attended meeting with Bryan and the management to 

discuss updates re AR, AP, banking; attended a call with 

Bryan, Tim Hogan and Brendan to discuss next steps

SWARNER2023-04-05 $158.00 0.40 $395.00Reviewed and commented on creditors package

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-05 $1,106.00 2.80 $395.00Prepared and assembled Notice to creditors of NOI 

filing package; call with Dmitry re list of creditors 

update; updated creditors, prepared new Creditor's 

package re NOI filing

BGELMAN2023-04-05 $847.50 1.50 $565.00Call with prospective lender (4) and introduction email; 

calls with Brendan Bissell re extension application; call 

with Paul Simpson; Review of preliminary cash flow 

forecast prepared by management; 

TMCELROY2023-04-05 $841.50 1.70 $495.00Email to T. Scott; Review and format NOI cash flow 

projection; 

TMCELROY2023-04-06 $1,336.50 2.70 $495.00Discuss cash flow forecast prepared by management 

with B. Gelman; Meeting with Terry and B. Gelman to 

discuss and review NOI cash flow forecast; Emails to 

Terry re cash flow projection; 

AROBINSON2023-04-06 $762.50 2.50 $305.00Mailed out Notice to Creditors package

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-06 $1,461.50 3.70 $395.00Meeting with Bryan re replanning, conversed with 

creditors re filing, explained the process, attended cash 

flow review meeting

BGELMAN2023-04-07 $3,220.50 5.70 $565.00Attend meeting with management (Terry, Dmitri and 

Adam) at head office; attend teams call with 

management, Tom McElroy and Ianina re development 

of cash flow and review of same; review and approval 

of creditors package for NOI: 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-07 $671.50 1.70 $395.00Reviewed TB and creditors, reviewed CF statement, 

sent out notices of NOI filing to creditors/shareholders

BGELMAN2023-04-09 $678.00 1.20 $565.00Review of updated cash flow forecast prepared by 

management; emails re same; Review of emails and 

financial statements prepared by Mark Potter at Norton 

McMullen; 

TMCELROY2023-04-09 $1,683.00 3.40 $495.00Review and finalize NOI cash flow forecast for both 

companies; Prepare froms 29 and 30; Prepare cash flow 

rep letters; Discuss cash flow projection with B. Gelman; 
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

DescriptionEmployee Rate AmountDate Hours

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-09 $474.00 1.20 $395.00Cash flow review, conversed with debtor through emails 

and phone

TMCELROY2023-04-10 $643.50 1.30 $495.00Email to/from management re cash flow projection; 

E-filed NOI cash flow forecasts for both companies; 

Videoconference with Debtor and Firepower re 

potential DIP financing; 

AROBINSON2023-04-10 $61.00 0.20 $305.00Sent corporate officer NOI cash flow through syngrafi 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-10 $1,106.00 2.80 $395.00Conversed with creditors re NOI filing, explained the 

process, discussed next steps, sent out Notices re NOI 

filing

BGELMAN2023-04-10 $621.50 1.10 $565.00Final review of cash flow and notes, revisions to same; 

sign same; Call with Terry Scott re 

AROBINSON2023-04-11 $91.50 0.30 $305.00Creditors questions re NOI filing

BGELMAN2023-04-11 $1,582.00 2.80 $565.00Email to David K. at RBC re cash flow statement; emails 

to Terry re same; email to potential lender re 

opportunity; attend teams call with Tom and Ianina re 

review of checklist; attend call with Brendan Bissell , 

Jessica from his office and Mario Forte; Attend teams 

call with Terry Scott, Tom and Ianina re to do list; 

TMCELROY2023-04-11 $841.50 1.70 $495.00Meeting with I. Rugimov and B. Gelman to discuss 

delegation of tasks and next steps re restructuring 

proceedings; Videoconferece with B. Gelman. I. 

Rugimov and Terry to discuss response to D. Kennedy 

and other matters; Draft email to D. Kennedy (RBC); 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-11 $1,106.00 2.80 $395.00Conversed with creditors re NOI filing, explained the 

process, discussed next steps, sent out Notice re NOI 

filing; team meeting re next steps in the engagement; 

meeting with Tom and Terry re CF and contracts 

disclaimers; email to debtor re 

agreement/lease/contract disclaimers

BGELMAN2023-04-12 $960.50 1.70 $565.00Attend meeting with Terry Scott and Mark Potter review 

of financial statements for Prosysco, 111 corp and 

parent company 209; Call from Prospective purchaser; 

Review and respond to email from counsel for Debtor re 

cash flow forecast; attend management meeting, 

including debtors counsel to discuss agenda; 

TMCELROY2023-04-12 $891.00 1.80 $495.00Video conference with M. Potter (external accountant), 

T. Scott, B. Gelman and I. Raguimov; Email to D. 

Kennedy (RBC); Videoconference with management, 

counsel to Debtor, Terry, B. Gelman and R. Raguimov; 
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-12 $1,817.00 4.60 $395.00Meeting with Mark, Tom, Terry and Bryan re CRA audit; 

meeting with Prosysco mgmt team and legal team re 

future steps and planning the engagement; drafted 

updated resolution of directors; reviewed creditors 

listing; communicated with creditors re filing by phone 

and email

BGELMAN2023-04-13 $1,130.00 2.00 $565.00Attend scheduling hearing; Review of revised cash flow 

model and security position analysis, revision to model 

and email back to Terry re same; Review of emails from 

Dmitry and respond to same re treatment of creditors in 

NOI and RBC; call from Terry re customer issue; call to 

Brendan re source deductions; 

TMCELROY2023-04-13 $1,089.00 2.20 $495.00Instruction to I. Rugimov re weekly cash flow monitoring 

procedures; Prepare form of director resolution re 

authorization for president to sign NOI/Proposal 

documents; Prepare form of commercial lease 

disclaimer; Draft Proposal Trustee's first report to Court; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-13 $1,343.00 3.40 $395.00Responded to voicemail and emails from creditors; 

communicated and responded to questions from 

debtors, communicated with legal team, researched 

and provided requested information to debtor's legal 

team

TMCELROY2023-04-14 $3,712.50 7.50 $495.00Continue drafting Trustee's First Report to Court; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-14 $632.00 1.60 $395.00Reviewed financial statements, reviewed CF monitoring 

guidelines, sent an email re CF monitoring requirements, 

communicated with creditors through phone calls and 

emails

TMCELROY2023-04-15 $99.00 0.20 $495.00Email to management re revised director resolution; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-15 $434.50 1.10 $395.00Reviewed financial data, reviewed list of creditors, 

communication with supplier, communication with 

debtor, communication with debtor's legal team

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-16 $237.00 0.60 $395.00Reviewed purchase orders and communication from 

debtor, supplier and legal team; communicated with 

debtor, supplier and legal team

BGELMAN2023-04-17 $960.50 1.70 $565.00Call to Terry re related party loans and supplier issue; 

Attend teams call to review checklist and delegation of 

tasks; Review of trial balance report from Debtor; 

Review of revised weekly cash flow and RBC security 

position; Call with Terry Scott re same; Review of 2021 

balance sheet and income statement; 

TMCELROY2023-04-17 $346.50 0.70 $495.00File status review meeting with B. Gelman and I. 

Rugimov; Emails to/from Terry re various matters; Email 

to Mark Potter (external accountant); Email to M. Forte 

(counsel); Discuss matters related to agreement 

terminations with I. Rugimov; 
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

DescriptionEmployee Rate AmountDate Hours

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-17 $1,501.00 3.80 $395.00Meetings with creditors re NOI filing, discussed and 

explained the process, explained pre and post NOI 

invoicing; meeting with prospective buyer, explained 

NOI filing reasoning and going concern; 

communication with legal team; communication with 

supplier's lawyer; communication with debtor's lawyer; 

communication with debtor re lease disclaimer, 

employees, contract

TMCELROY2023-04-18 $2,821.50 5.70 $495.00Continue drafting First Report; Discuss first report with B. 

Gelman; Call with Debtor counsel re motion record; 

Email to Dmitry re commercial lease disclaimer; 

Instructions to I. Rugimov re weekly cash flow 

monitoring; Review of draft form of Court order 

prepared by Debtor counsel; Review of draft form of 

affadvit of Terrence Scott; Review of Debtor motion 

record; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-18 $711.00 1.80 $395.00Meeting with Tom re CF monitoring, started CF data 

monitoring; communicated with creditors re NOI filing, 

explained the process, discussed the consequences

BGELMAN2023-04-18 $1,412.50 2.50 $565.00Review of monitoring data sent to Ianina by email; calls 

Ianina re monitoring procedures and instructions re 

same; Review of PPSA summary; review and comments 

to first draft of report to Court; Review and approval of 

draft order for extension and consolidation; 

BGELMAN2023-04-19 $1,921.00 3.40 $565.00Further review of the Trustee's first report to Court and 

appendices, sign off on sme; Review of opinions on RBC 

security provided by Mario Forte; Review of emails 

pertaining to lease disclaimers; Call with Tim Hogan re 

update; Prepare case website; 

TMCELROY2023-04-19 $1,039.50 2.10 $495.00Review security opinion re RBC prepare by counsel; 

Finalize First Report; Assemble appendices; Review of 

lease agreements re 8 Prologis and prepare notice of 

disclaimer; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-19 $2,409.50 6.10 $395.00Reviewed bank statements, reviewed accounting 

entries, reviewed CF statement provided, conversation 

with controller re CF; prepared CF monitoring for week 

of April 10-April 14

AROBINSON2023-04-20 $30.50 0.10 $305.00Efiled First Report

TMCELROY2023-04-20 $445.50 0.90 $495.00Email to Dmitry; Instructions to A. Robinson re revised 

director resolution; Further revisions to form of director 

resolution; Update Case Website; Finalize commercial 

lease disclaimer; Email to Debtor counsel re same; 

AROBINSON2023-04-20 $30.50 0.10 $305.00Sent corporate office revised directors resolution form 
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-20 $513.50 1.30 $395.00Conversation with creditors, explained NOI filing and 

consequences, phone call with landlord, email 

communication with landlord, scheduled a meeting 

with landlord, communication with debtor re CF and 

RBC statements

BGELMAN2023-04-20 $113.00 0.20 $565.00Call from Terry Scott re Vault loan; 

TMCELROY2023-04-21 $1,485.00 3.00 $495.00Travel to/form Debtor premises for meeting with Terry 

and tour of facility; 

SWARNER2023-04-21 $79.00 0.20 $395.00Call from Ron Lalonde of BFC Technologies re interest in 

working with the company

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-21 $118.50 0.30 $395.00Conversing with debtors through email, discussed 

restructuring fees

TMCELROY2023-04-24 $148.50 0.30 $495.00Discuss cash flow monitoring with I. Rugimov; 

BGELMAN2023-04-24 $226.00 0.40 $565.00Review and approval of cash flow monitoring; update 

from Tom McElroy re same; Review of lease disclaimers; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-24 $869.00 2.20 $395.00Prepared for Court hearing; reviewed Trustee's First 

Report; Reviewed Motion Record; attended Court 

hearing; communicated with landlord; communicated 

with debtor re CF monitoring

BGELMAN2023-04-25 $452.00 0.80 $565.00Conduct file review;

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-25 $987.50 2.50 $395.00Created and sent out PAD request form; started CF 

review

TMCELROY2023-04-26 $297.00 0.60 $495.00Update Case Website; Discuss cash flow monitoring 

analysis with Iana; 

AROBINSON2023-04-26 $61.00 0.20 $305.00Efiled order and counsel slip endorsement 

BGELMAN2023-04-26 $56.50 0.10 $565.00Review of email relating to Vault loan payments; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-26 $1,659.00 4.20 $395.00Completed cash flow monitoring for week of April 15- 

April 22

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-27 $79.00 0.20 $395.00Reviewed Cash Flow, sent follow up questions to debtor

BGELMAN2023-04-28 $169.50 0.30 $565.00Respond to email from prospective purchaser counsel; 

Update call with Brendan Bissell and Terry Scott re RBC 

Visa; 

$73,357.50Total Fees:

HST: $9,536.48
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6366

Prosysco Ltd.

360 Ambassador Dr,

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: PROSYSCO-P:

Summary by Staff:

Hours Rate Amount

Ashley Robinson   (Estate Administrator)  3.40 $1,037.00$305.00

Bryan A. Gelman   (Principal, CIRP LIT)  42.40 $23,956.00$565.00

Ianina Raguimov   (LIT,CIRP)  73.10 $28,874.50$395.00

Suzette Warner   (Associate, CFE,CPA,CGA,FCCA)  3.10 $1,224.50$395.00

Tom McElroy   (Mgr, CPA, CA, CBV, CIRP, LIT)  36.90 $18,265.50$495.00

Disbursements:

Non-Taxable Disbursements

SEARCH FEES: $40.00

Taxable Disbursements

PROMERIC FEE: $190.00

SEARCH FEES: $39.00

TRAVEL: $57.04

Total Disbursements: $326.04

HST: $37.20

 Amount Due This Invoice: $83,257.22

Invoice Summary:

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS: $73,683.54 

TOTAL HST: $9,573.68 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $83,257.22 

Payment of this account is due on receipt

HST Registration # 83741 9514 RT0001

HST No. 83741 9514 RT 0001
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Re: Proposal of 1110615 Ontario Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6365

1110615 Ontario Ltd.

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: 1110615ONT-P:

Professional Fees:

DescriptionEmployee Rate AmountDate Hours

BGELMAN2023-03-31 $847.50 1.50 $565.00Review of searches, financial information and draft NOI 

documents; comments and instructions to Ianina R re 

same; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-03-31 $1,185.00 3.00 $395.00Reviewed financial data, meeting with debtor, senior 

management and lawyer, completed file set up in 

Ascend

BGELMAN2023-04-01 $1,017.00 1.80 $565.00Attend management meeting and sign up meeting of 

NOI; 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-01 $869.00 2.20 $395.00Reviewed financial documents; attended meeting with 

management; prepared signing documents

BGELMAN2023-04-03 $282.50 0.50 $565.00Call to David Kennedy at RBC re update; update Paul 

Chimko re next steps; contact lenders to discuss short 

and long term financing; 

SWARNER2023-04-05 $158.00 0.40 $395.00Reviewed and commented on creditors package

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-05 $355.50 0.90 $395.00Prepared Notice to creditors of NOI filing package

BGELMAN2023-04-05 $169.50 0.30 $565.00Review and approval of statutory notice of NOI to 

creditors; 

AROBINSON2023-04-06 $213.50 0.70 $305.00Mailed out NOI package 

IRAGUIMOV2023-04-06 $513.50 1.30 $395.00Meeting with Bryan and management re re planning 

and future steps, discussed ongoing restructuring

BGELMAN2023-04-07 $282.50 0.50 $565.00Attend meeting with management (Terry, Dmitri and 

Adam) at head office;

AROBINSON2023-04-10 $61.00 0.20 $305.00Prepared NOI Cash flow package in syngrafi 

BGELMAN2023-04-10 $113.00 0.20 $565.00Final review of cash flow and notes, revisions to same; 

sign same; 

TMCELROY2023-04-13 $198.00 0.40 $495.00Prepare form of director resolution re authorization 

Terrence Scott to sign NOI/Proposal documents;

AROBINSON2023-04-20 $30.50 0.10 $305.00Efiled first report 

AROBINSON2023-04-20 $30.50 0.10 $305.00Sent corporate office revised directors resolution

BGELMAN2023-04-25 $452.00 0.80 $565.00Conduct file review; 

$6,778.50Total Fees:

HST: $881.21
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Re: Proposal of 1110615 Ontario Ltd.

Invoice Date: May 8, 2023

Invoice No: 6365

1110615 Ontario Ltd.

Mr. Terry Scott Attention:

Billing Through: Apr 30, 2023

Invoice

File ID: 1110615ONT-P:

Summary by Staff:

Hours Rate Amount

Ashley Robinson   (Estate Administrator)  1.10 $335.50$305.00

Bryan A. Gelman   (Principal, CIRP LIT)  5.60 $3,164.00$565.00

Ianina Raguimov   (LIT,CIRP)  7.40 $2,923.00$395.00

Suzette Warner   (Associate, CFE,CPA,CGA,FCCA)  0.40 $158.00$395.00

Tom McElroy   (Mgr, CPA, CA, CBV, CIRP, LIT)  0.40 $198.00$495.00

Disbursements:

Non-Taxable Disbursements

SEARCH FEES: $16.00

Taxable Disbursements

PROMERIC FEE: $190.00

SEARCH FEES: $39.00

Total Disbursements: $245.00

HST: $29.78

 Amount Due This Invoice: $7,934.49

Invoice Summary:

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS: $7,023.50 

TOTAL HST: $910.99 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $7,934.49 

Payment of this account is due on receipt

HST Registration # 83741 9514 RT0001

HST No. 83741 9514 RT 0001
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd. 

Invoice Date: Jun 6, 2023 

Invoice No: <3825-1> 

Prosysco Ltd. 

360 Ambassador Dr, 

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3 

Mr. Terry Scott  Attention: 

Billing Through: Jun 5, 2023 

Invoice 

File ID: PROSYSCO-P: 

Professional Fees: 

Description Employee Rate Amount Date Hours 

BGELMAN 2023-05-01 $169.50  0.30 $565.00 Call with Terry Scott re accounting invoice; respond to 

prospective purchaser;  

TMCELROY 2023-05-01 $49.50  0.10 $495.00 Approve disbursement;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-01 $118.50  0.30 $395.00 Communicated with creditors, reviewed statements sent 

an email 

BGELMAN 2023-05-02 $282.50  0.50 $565.00 Respond to email from prospective investor/purchaser; 

Review of leases and contracts to be terminated;  

TMCELROY 2023-05-02 $198.00  0.40 $495.00 Review and consider correspondence from Dimitry re 

disclaimer of various leases; Discuss matter with I. 

Raguimov;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-02 $869.00  2.20 $395.00 Communication with debtor through multiple emails, 

reviewed PAD set up; research and review of relevant 

statues and BIA, in-office meeting to discuss outstanding 

issues and solutions 

BGELMAN 2023-05-03 $282.50  0.50 $565.00 Call from Michael and Patrick at BWT re their concerns; 

Update call with Terry S;  

TMCELROY 2023-05-03 $148.50  0.30 $495.00 Call with Terry, Dmitry and I. Raguimov re disclaimer of 

various agreements;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-03 $829.50  2.10 $395.00 Communication with debtor, meeting with a creditor, 

advised on NOI filing, explained the process, answered 

questions, meeting with Terry, Dmitry and Tom re lease 

disclaimers 

TMCELROY 2023-05-05 $198.00  0.40 $495.00 Discuss lease disclaimer and preparation for notices with I. 

Raguimov;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-05 $829.50  2.10 $395.00 Email re cash flow monitoring, meeting with Tom re lease 

disclaimers, prepared required lease disclaimers 

BGELMAN 2023-05-08 $56.50  0.10 $565.00 Review and approval of March 2023 Bank reconciliation;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-08 $513.50  1.30 $395.00 Reviewed received letter from Triovest, researched lease 

disclaimers, sent a copy to debtor and legal team. 

communication with debtor re invoices, in office 

communication re balance transfers  

BGELMAN 2023-05-09 $169.50  0.30 $565.00 Review and respond to Dmitry email re landlord;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-09 $158.00  0.40 $395.00 Received email communication from debtor, reviewed 

billing and trust accounts, created copies of the ledger 

accounts, sent copies to debtor, communication with 

creditor, scheduled meeting with creditors to discuss NOI 

filing 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-10 $118.50  0.30 $395.00 Communication with creditor, explained NOI filing, process 

and procedures 

BGELMAN 2023-05-10 $113.00  0.20 $565.00 Call with Terry re management salaries;  
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd. 

Invoice Date: Jun 6, 2023 

Invoice No: <3825-1> 

Prosysco Ltd. 

360 Ambassador Dr, 

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3 

Mr. Terry Scott  Attention: 

Billing Through: Jun 5, 2023 

Invoice 

File ID: PROSYSCO-P: 

Professional Fees: 

Description Employee Rate Amount Date Hours 

JALBERT 2023-05-11 $63.00  0.10 $630.00 review/sign cheques 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-11 $2,212.00  5.60 $395.00 Reviewed financial statements, reviewed provided income 

and expenses, prepared weekly CAD cash flow monitoring 

models, communication with debtor re lease disclaimers, 

conversation with debtor re payroll 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-12 $1,422.00  3.60 $395.00 Sent an email re cash flow questions; USD cash flow 

statements review and monitoring, meeting with Tom re CF 

monitoring, discussed projected vs actual numbers, 

communication re lease disclaimers, communication re 

payroll 

TMCELROY 2023-05-12 $247.50  0.50 $495.00 Review cash flow monitoring schedules and discuss same 

with I. Raguimov;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-12 $113.00  0.20 $565.00 Review and comments to email to Terry Scott re Paul 

Chimko and his wife's payroll;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-15 $113.00  0.20 $565.00 Call with Terry Scott re employment issue;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-15 $948.00  2.40 $395.00 File review, reviewed communication with debtor, 

reviewed information sent by debtor, responded back with 

a follow up email, meeting with Bryan and Terry to discuss 

payroll and continuation of employment/severance; 

received email from debtor re outstanding invoices, 

researched lease disclaimers, called debtor to get 

clarification on invoices, discussion with BG of outstanding 

invoices, responded back to debtor, started preparing 

lease disclaimers and cover letters  

TMCELROY 2023-05-15 $148.50  0.30 $495.00 Discuss with I. Raguimov and review various lease 

disclaimers;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-16 $1,264.00  3.20 $395.00 Prepared final copies of lease disclaimers, prepared cover 

letter of lease disclaimers, communication with debtor re 

creditors, communication with debtor re payroll 

TMCELROY 2023-05-17 $99.00  0.20 $495.00 Email to Debtor counsel re second extension; Discuss 

potential further extension with B. Gelman;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-17 $56.50  0.10 $565.00 Update call with Tom re next steps for extension;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-17 $1,066.50  2.70 $395.00 Finalized lease disclaimers, sent out copies for signature, 

prepared courier packages, sent out emails, conversation 

with debtor re follow up and final steps, conversation with 

de 

BGELMAN 2023-05-18 $169.50  0.30 $565.00 Update call with Tim Hogan, counsel for RBC: Review and 

respond to email from Brendan Bissell re extension motion;  
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd. 

Invoice Date: Jun 6, 2023 

Invoice No: <3825-1> 

Prosysco Ltd. 

360 Ambassador Dr, 

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3 

Mr. Terry Scott  Attention: 

Billing Through: Jun 5, 2023 

Invoice 

File ID: PROSYSCO-P: 

Description Employee Rate Amount Date Hours 

TMCELROY 2023-05-18 $49.50  0.10 $495.00 Discuss lease disclaimers with I. Ragiumov;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-18 $316.00  0.80 $395.00 Communication with debtor re vehicle pay out, reviewed 

received PPSA discharge, started reviewing received 

financial data,  

BGELMAN 2023-05-19 $226.00  0.40 $565.00 Call with Brendan Bissell re next steps; call with Terry Scott 

re action plan; 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-19 $118.50  0.30 $395.00 Reviewed lease disclaimer contracts, communication with 

debtor re lease disclaimers, communication with lease 

holders re lease disclaiming 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-22 $1,659.00  4.20 $395.00 Weekly Cash Flow monitoring started 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-23 $355.50  0.90 $395.00 Communication with debtor re outstanding cash flow 

questions, communication with lessor re lease disclaimer 

disclaimers 

BGELMAN 2023-05-23 $169.50  0.30 $565.00 Update call with David Kennedy at RBC;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-24 $565.00  1.00 $565.00 Attend conference call with Terry Scott, Brendan, Jessica, 

Tom re next steps for court hearing for extension 

application;  

TMCELROY 2023-05-24 $693.00  1.40 $495.00 Attend video conference with B. Gelman, B. Bissell, 

Terrance Scott and Jessica Wuthmann; Debrief discussion 

with B. Bissell and Jessica Wuthmann;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-24 $434.50  1.10 $395.00 Email follow up to debtor sent, review of financial data 

received, landlord letter review, communication with 

debtor re lease disclaimer, attended meeting with Terry, 

legal counsel and BG re Prosysco future plans 

TMCELROY 2023-05-25 $346.50  0.70 $495.00 Discuss equipment appraisal with B. Gelman; Discuss 

potential SISP and implications re same with B. Gelman; 

Email to management re equipment appraisal;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-25 $948.00  2.40 $395.00 Communication with debtor re cash flow disbursements, 

cash flow disbursement review, communication with 

creditors, communication with lease holders 

BGELMAN 2023-05-25 $226.00  0.40 $565.00 Call with Tom McElroy re options for proposal filings; call 

with Brendan Bissell re same;  

TMCELROY 2023-05-25 $1,435.50  2.90 $495.00 Draft Second Report to Court;  

AROBINSON 2023-05-26 $30.50  0.10 $305.00 Reviewed and entered poc  

BGELMAN 2023-05-26 $169.50  0.30 $565.00 Call with Iana re cash flow forecast;  
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd. 

Invoice Date: Jun 6, 2023 

Invoice No: <3825-1> 

Prosysco Ltd. 

360 Ambassador Dr, 

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3 

Mr. Terry Scott  Attention: 

Billing Through: Jun 5, 2023 

Invoice 

File ID: PROSYSCO-P: 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-26 $1,027.00  2.60 $395.00 Communication with creditor and creditor's counsel; 

scheduled next week meeting with counsel; 

communication with contract holder, inquired information 

re contract from debtor, communication with debtor re 

outstanding amount, scheduled and attended meeting 

with creditor, communication with debtor re termination 

pay, termination pay provisions review, completed weekly 

cash flow monitoring 

TMCELROY 2023-05-29 $346.50  0.70 $495.00 Email to Terry re revised weekly cash flow forecast; Review 

of Prosysco monitoring schedules; Discuss same with I. 

Raguimov;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-29 $113.00  0.20 $565.00 Meeting to review cash flow forecast and variance 

analysis;  

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-29 $553.00  1.40 $395.00 Meeting with TM re weekly Cash Flow monitoring, meeting 

with BG and TM  re projected vs actual CF, 

communication with debtor re scheduling meeting, 

meeting with landlord's counsel 

IRAGUIMOV 2023-05-30 $118.50  0.30 $395.00 Communication with debtor re cash flow review meeting; 

attended cash flow meeting with TM and Terrence Scott 

TMCELROY 2023-05-30 $148.50  0.30 $495.00 Call with Terry to discuss cash flow monitoring schedules; 

Review of revised CRA letter re source deduction arrears;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-30 $113.00  0.20 $565.00 Review of cash flow variance from T. McElroy;  

BGELMAN 2023-05-31 $678.00  1.20 $565.00 Review of emails pertaining to extension of time to file a 

proposal and Debtor's counsel email with RBC; Calls with 

Terry Scott; Call with Tim Hogan re disclaimer of RBC lease; 

Call with Sia Mizrahi;  

TMCELROY 2023-05-31 $49.50  0.10 $495.00 Review and respond to correspondence from Debtor 

counsel re court hearing;  

AROBINSON 2023-06-01 $30.50  0.10 $305.00 Prepared April 2023 bank rec 

BGELMAN 2023-06-01 $452.00  0.80 $565.00 Call from Terry Scott re withdrawal of lease disclaimer with 

RBC; call from Sia Mizrahi re sale of furniture; review of 

payroll examination and other reports provided by Terry 

Scott;   

IRAGUIMOV 2023-06-01 $434.50  1.10 $395.00 Received weekly cash flow data, started preparing weekly 

cash flow monitoring model 

BGELMAN 2023-06-01 $56.50  0.10 $565.00 Review and approval of April 30, 2023 bank reconciliation;  

BGELMAN 2023-06-02 $113.00  0.20 $565.00 Update call with Terry Scott re financial and next steps;  

BGELMAN 2023-06-05 $339.00  0.60 $565.00 Review of emails pertaining to the rescinding of RBC 

disclaimer; Review and approval of draft order for 

extension motion; Review of email re payment of source 

deductions;  
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Re: Proposal of Prosysco Ltd. 

Invoice Date: Jun 6, 2023 

Invoice No: <3825-1> 

Prosysco Ltd. 

360 Ambassador Dr, 

Mississauga, ON L5T 2J3 

Mr. Terry Scott  Attention: 

Billing Through: Jun 5, 2023 

Invoice 

File ID: PROSYSCO-P: 

$25,341.50 Total Fees: 

HST: $3,294.40 

Summary by Staff: 

Hours Rate Amount 

Ashley Robinson   (Estate Administrator)  0.20 $61.00 $305.00 

Bryan A. Gelman   (Principal, CIRP LIT)  8.40 $4,746.00 $565.00 

Ianina Raguimov   (LIT,CIRP)  41.30 $16,313.50 $395.00 

Joe E. Albert   (Principal, CIRP,CPA,DIFA. LIT)  0.10 $63.00 $630.00 

Tom McElroy   (Mgr, CPA, CA, CBV, CIRP, LIT)  8.40 $4,158.00 $495.00 

Disbursements: 

Non-Taxable Disbursements 

SEARCH FEES: $8.00 

Taxable Disbursements 

POSTAGE: $2.76 

Total Disbursements: $10.76 

HST: $0.36 

 Amount Due This Invoice: $28,647.02 

Invoice Summary: 

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS: $25,352.26  

TOTAL HST: $3,294.76  

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $28,647.02  

Payment of this account is due on receipt 

HST Registration # 83741 9514 RT0001 

HST No. 83741 9514 RT 0001 
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PROSYSCO LTD. and  
110615 ONTARIO LTD. 
 

Court File Nos. 32-2929201 
    32-2929202 

 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

  
SECOND REPORT OF ALBERT GELMAN INC. 

in its capacity as 
PROPOSAL TRUSTEE 

(June 8, 2023) 
 

  

 


	Appendix B1 - 004 Order - 2023-04-24.pdf
	SERVICE
	1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and the Motion Record is hereby abridged and validated so that this Motion is properly returnable today and hereby dispenses with further service thereof.
	2. THIS COURT ORDERS that, without prejudice to the right of any party to seek or oppose substantive consolidation,
	(a) the present proceeding; and
	(b) the matter of the notice of intention to make a proposal of 1110615 Ontario Ltd.  Bankruptcy Court File No. BK-23-02929202-0032 and Estate No. 32-2929202,
	(a) sending notices to the creditors of Prosysco Ltd. and 1110615 Ontario Ltd. (collectively, the “NOI Entities”) pursuant to one consolidated notice;
	(b) calling and conducting any meetings of creditors of the NOI Entities pursuant to one combined advertisement and one meeting;
	(c) issuing consolidated reports in respect of the estates of the NOI Entities;
	(d) preparing, filing, advertising and distributing any and all filings and/or notices relating to the administration of the estates of the NOI Entities on a consolidated basis; and
	(e) bringing motions to this Honourable Court on a consolidated basis.

	3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the NOI Proceedings shall be assigned the single Bankruptcy Court File No. BK-23-02929201-0032 and Estate File Number 32-2929201 (the “Consolidated Court File”) and the following title of proceeding:
	4. THIS COURT ORDERS that a copy of this Order shall be filed by the NOI Entities in the court file for each of the NOI Proceedings but that any other document required to be filed in any of the NOI Proceedings shall hereafter only be required to be f...
	5. THIS COURT ORDERS that for avoidance of doubt, any motion, application or action, including the herein motion, in respect of the NOI Entities or any of them shall be brought and filed in the Consolidated Court File and if so brought and filed it sh...
	6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the procedural consolidation of the NOI Proceedings shall not:
	(a) affect the separate legal status and structures of any of the NOI Entities;
	(b) cause any of the NOI Entities to be liable for any claim for which it otherwise is not liable; or
	(c) affect the Proposal Trustee’s or a creditor’s right to seek to disallow any claim, including on the basis that such claim is a duplicative claim.

	EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE A PROPOSAL
	7. THIS COURT ORDERS that pursuant to Section 50.4(9) of the BIA, the time for the NOI Entities to file a proposal with the Official Receiver be and is hereby extended up to and including June 14, 2023 (the “Stay Period”).
	CONTINUATION OF SERVICES
	8. THIS COURT ORDERS that during the Stay Period, all persons having oral or written agreements with the NOI Entities or statutory or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods and/or services are hereby restrained until further Order of this Court f...
	9. THIS COURT ORDERS that the First Report of the Proposal Trustee, and the actions, conduct and activities of the Proposal Trustee as set out therein, be and are hereby approved; provided, however, that only the Proposal Trustee, in its personal capa...
	GENERAL
	10. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States, to give effect to this Order and to assist the NOI Entities, the Proposal Trustee a...
	11. THIS COURT ORDERS that any interested party (including the NOI Entities and the Proposal Trustee) may apply to this Court to vary or amend this Order on not less than seven (7) days notice to any other party or parties likely to be affected by the...
	12. THIS COURT ORDERS that notwithstanding Rule 59.05, this Order is effective from 12:01 a.m. on the date that it is made and is enforceable without any need for entry and filing.  In accordance with Rules 77.07(6) and 1.04, no formal order need be e...




